
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

The last March Madness game was over a month ago, but basketball season is still going strong in 
New York City with the New York Knicks in the NBA Eastern Conference semifinal series. They 
defeated defending champion Boston Celtics in two games in Boston, and return to Madison Square 
Garden on Saturday, May 10. If the Knicks win two more games, they will advance to the Eastern 
finals for the first time since 2000. 

Hell Gate calls the Knicks the only sports team that brings the city together, as opposed to divisions 
between Yankees/Mets and Jets/Giants fans. The excitement shows in ticket prices: ESPN observes 
that the cheapest resale ticket for Saturday's game is over $600. 

The game will take place on a day with a sunny forecast in the low 70s, one that might have some 
feeling more inclined to hit the court than sit inside. Basketball courts at the city's parks are likely to fill 
up fast, but some lucky New Yorkers are well positioned to get in the game: Condos and rentals all 
over the city count indoor basketball courts among their amenities. And for those who'd rather watch 
than play, the extensive amenity packages also include lounges with big-screen TVs. 

 

 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

 

 

 

 

Nearly 100 years after it was constructed as a hotel, 720 West End Avenue has been converted to 
residences. The Emery Roth-designed facade has been restored to its original glory, but the interiors 
have been updated with beautifully appointed apartments and approximately 30,000 square feet of 
amenities that include a state-of-the-art fitness center with multipurpose court for basketball and 
squash. 



 

 

 

 

From the Listing: Designed by renowned architect and designer Thomas Juul Hansen, Residence 
5M is a three-bedroom, three-bathroom with double exposure to the south over Pomander Walk and 
to the north with views over the landscaped terrace. Boasting a custom Italian kitchen by Boffi featuring 
a hand selected honed Namibia Rose marble countertop and backsplash, white oak cabinetry, fluted, 
reflective bronze upper doors and Waterworks polished chrome hardware. Professional-grade 
appliances include Sub-Zero refrigerator, Wolf range, Wolf speed oven, wine fridge, and Cove 
dishwasher. See floor plan and full details here. 

 

 

  

 

 

 

 

 

https://www.cityrealty.com/nyc/market-insight/rental-building-offers/financial-district/as-knicks-surge-
playoffs-see-25-nyc-condo-rental-buildings-basketball-courts/29161 


